Bid# 54-CA-PR6377 -On Call Stormwater Control M	leasure Repair Services	
Bid Opening: May 30, 2024	SBE Certification Required?	No
Procurement Specialist: Christian Andresen	Prequalification Required?	Yes
Witness: Mike Beaver and Isaac Snype	Mandatory Pre-Bid Conference?	No

Vendor 1	Item	Description	QTY	Unit	Unit Price	<b>Extended Price</b>
Opterra Solutions, Inc.						
		Eastern Region - Divisions 1, 2,				
Total Bid for Project:	1	3, and 4	1	Total	\$796,056.70	\$796,056.70
		Central Region - Divisions 5, 6,				
Total Bid for Project:	2	7, 8, 9, and 10	1	Total	\$1,250,123.40	\$1,250,123.40
		Western Region - Divisions 11,			4=00.000.40	4
Total Bid for Project:	3	12, 13, and 14	1	Total	\$790,833.10	\$790,833.10
Vendor 2						
North State Environmental						
		Eastern Region - Divisions 1, 2,				
Total Bid for Project:	1	3, and 4	1	Total	\$420,246.10	\$420,246.10
		Central Region - Divisions 5, 6,				
Total Bid for Project:	2	7, 8, 9, and 10	1	Total	\$720,464.50	\$720,464.50
		Western Region - Divisions 11,				
Total Bid for Project:	3	12, 13, and 14	1	Total	\$407,023.00	\$407,023.00

Vendor 3						
HGS, LLC dba RES Environmental Operating Company,						
LLC						
		Eastern Region - Divisions 1, 2,				
Total Bid for Project:	1	3, and 4	1	Total	No Bid	No Bid
		Central Region - Divisions 5, 6,				
Total Bid for Project:	2	7, 8, 9, and 10	1	Total	\$716,190.00	\$716,190.00
		Western Region - Divisions 11,				
Total Bid for Project:	3	12, 13, and 14	1	Total	No Bid	No Bid